
Izvirnik

Nihče ne sme biti podvržen mučenju, nečloveškemu ali 
ponižujočemu kaznovanju ali ravnanju. Na človeku je 
prepovedano delati medicinske ali druge znanstvene 
poskuse brez njegove svobodne privolitve.

Uradni prevod

No one may be subjected to torture, inhuman or degrading 
punishment or treatment. The conducting of medical or 
other scientific experiments on any person without his free 
consent is prohibited.

Google 
Translate

No one shall be subjected to torture, inhuman or degrading 
punishment or treatment. It is forbidden to perform 
medical or other scientific experiments on a person without 
his free consent.

Bing Translator

No one shall be subjected to torture, inhuman or degrading 
punishment or punishment. It is forbidden to do medical or 
other scientific experiments on a human being without his 
free consent.

Yandex 
Translate

No one shall be subjected to torture, inhuman or degrading 
punishment or treatment. It is forbidden to do medical or 
other scientific experiments on a person without his free 
consent.

DeepL

No one shall be subjected to torture, inhuman or degrading 
punishment or treatment. No person shall be subjected to 
medical or other scientific experimentation without his or 
her free consent.

PONS

No one shall be subjected to torture, inhuman or degrading 
punishment or treatment. It is forbidden to conduct 
medical or other scientific experiments on human beings 
without their free consent.

Amebis

Nobody may be susceptible to torture, inhuman or 
degrading punishment or treatment. It is forbidden to make 
the medical or second scientific attempts without his free 
consent in a person.

ChatGPT

No one shall be subjected to torture or to cruel, inhuman or 
degrading treatment or punishment. It is forbidden to carry 
out medical or other scientific experiments on a person 
without their free consent.
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